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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.

20 De Boers Drive suite 525
Toronto ON  M3H 0H1

t. 416.901.6528  f. 416.901.8962
www.studiojci.com

CLIENT:

ARCHITECT:

DATE:DESCRIPTION:

Revisions:

Oct. 11, 2019Issued for ZBA

DRAWING NO.:

PROJECT NO.:
SCALE:
DATE:
DRAWN BY:

ADDRESS:
89-95 DUNDAS STREET WEST, MISSISSAUGA

MISSISSAUGA MIXED-USE BUILDING

OCTOBER 11, 2019

1907

LANDSCAPE:

SEFERIAN DESIGN GROUP

CIVIL:

SKIRA & ASSOCIATES LIMITED

761 Brant Street, Suite 202,
Burlington, ON L7R 2H7

t. 905.634.3110

3464 Semenyk Court, Suite 100,
Mississauga, ON L5C 4P8

t. 905.276.5100

22 Adelaide Street W, Suite 2060,
Toronto, ON M5H 4E3

t. 647.933.0024

SOUTH ELEVATION

1:200

RM

A5.00



PR
O

PE
RT

Y 
LI

N
E

GROUND LEVEL - AMENITY
-0.9 (114.50)

GROUND LEVEL - COMM. ENTRIES
-1.65 (113.75)

EX
IS

TI
N

G 
PR

O
PE

RT
Y 

LI
N

E

2ND FLOOR

8TH FLOOR

7TH FLOOR

6TH FLOOR

5TH FLOOR

4TH FLOOR

3RD FLOOR

P1

P2

P3

9TH FLOOR

10TH FLOOR

11TH FLOOR

12TH FLOOR

13TH FLOOR

14TH FLOOR

15TH FLOOR

ROOF

P4

GROUND LEVEL - RESI. ENTRY
-0.8 (114.60)ESTABLISHED GRADE

-1.16 (114.48)

16TH FLOOR

GROUND LEVEL - TOWN. ENTRIES
0.0 (115.40)

MEZZANINE

52
02

0

46
50

30
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

35
00

29
00

35
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

29
00

33
00

43
50

18
05

0
47

00
23

60
0

64
00

AGNES
STREET

DUNDAS
STREET WEST

BU
IL

DI
N

G 
HE

IG
HT

 N
EW

 P
RO

PE
RT

Y 
LI

N
E 

(4
2m

 R
.O

.W
.)

General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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General Notes:

1. These Contract Documents are the property of the
Architect. The Architect bears no responsibility for the
interpretations of these documents by the Contractor.
Upon written application the Architect will provide
written/graphic clarification or supplementary information
regarding the intent of the Contract Documents. The
Architect will review Shop Drawings submitted by the
Contractor for design conformance only.

2. Drawings are not to be scaled for construction.
Contractor to verify all existing conditions and dimensions
required to perform the Work and report any discrepancies
with the Contract Documents to the Architect before
commencing work.

3. Positions of exposed or finished mechanical or electrical
devices, fittings, and fixtures are indicated on the
Architectural drawings. The locations shown on the
Architectural drawings govern over the Mechanical and
Electrical drawings. Those items not clearly located will be
located as directed by the Architect.
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